
Bid Reconciliation

0118-0920

BEACHSIDE LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE (LOT 1)

Item Subtotal Item Subtotal Item Subtotal Item Subtotal Item Subtotal

Location A : Breakers Park

Base Maintenance Month 12 412.04$     4,944.48$         2,000.00$  24,000.00$        466.00$  5,592.00$        700.00$     8,400.00$       2,100.00$       25,200.00$     

Irrigation Service - 13 Zones Per Service 6 113.75$     682.50$             150.00$     900.00$             122.00$  732.00$           200.00$     1,200.00$       530.00$          3,180.00$       

Fert/Pest Control– Tree/Shrub Per Service 4 100.00$     400.00$             500.00$     2,000.00$          67.00$     268.00$           75.00$        300.00$          150.00$          600.00$          

Fert/Pest Control– Turf Per Service 6 225.00$     1,350.00$         200.00$     1,200.00$          203.00$  1,218.00$        100.00$     600.00$          170.00$          1,020.00$       

Mulch - Installed as Needed Per Yard 150 28.00$        4,200.00$         30.00$        4,500.00$          40.00$     6,000.00$        40.00$        6,000.00$       55.00$            8,250.00$       

Base Maintenance Month 12 772.41$     9,268.92$         1,000.00$  12,000.00$        850.00$  10,200.00$      1,950.00$  23,400.00$     840.00$          10,080.00$     

Irrigation Service - 12 Zones Per Service 6 105.00$     630.00$             150.00$     900.00$             112.00$  672.00$           400.00$     2,400.00$       465.00$          2,790.00$       

Fert/Pest Control– Turf Per Service 6 225.00$     1,350.00$         50.00$        300.00$             230.00$  1,380.00$        300.00$     1,800.00$       300.00$          1,800.00$       

Fert/Pest Control– Tree/Shrub Per Service 4 262.50$     1,050.00$         150.00$     600.00$             350.00$  1,400.00$        150.00$     600.00$          250.00$          1,000.00$       

Mulch - Installed as Needed Per Yard 150 28.00$        4,200.00$         30.00$        4,500.00$          40.00$     6,000.00$        40.00$        6,000.00$       55.00$            8,250.00$       

Base Maintenance Month 12 728.45$     8,741.40$         1,500.00$  18,000.00$        863.00$  10,356.00$      1,850.00$  22,200.00$     1,491.00$       17,892.00$     

Irrigation Service - 10 Zones Per Service 6 87.50$        525.00$             150.00$     900.00$             93.00$     558.00$           500.00$     3,000.00$       400.00$          2,400.00$       

Fert/Pest Control– Turf Per Service 6 205.00$     1,230.00$         200.00$     1,200.00$          180.00$  1,080.00$        500.00$     3,000.00$       250.00$          1,500.00$       

Fert/Pest Control– Tree/Shrub Per Service 4 112.50$     450.00$             150.00$     600.00$             78.00$     312.00$           75.00$        300.00$          300.00$          1,200.00$       

Mulch - Installed as Needed Per Yard 150 22.40$        3,360.00$         30.00$        4,500.00$          40.00$     6,000.00$        40.00$        6,000.00$       55.00$            8,250.00$       

Location D : A1A - Boylston Ave to 3001 N Atlantic Ave (McDonald's)

Base Maintenance Month 12 1,376.91$  16,522.92$       1,200.00$  14,400.00$        970.00$  11,640.00$      1,950.00$  23,400.00$     1,470.00$       17,640.00$     

Irrigation Service - 16 Zones Per Service 6 140.00$     840.00$             150.00$     900.00$             150.00$  900.00$           500.00$     3,000.00$       680.00$          4,080.00$       

Fert/Pest Control– Turf Per Service 6 325.00$     1,950.00$         200.00$     1,200.00$          490.00$  2,940.00$        500.00$     3,000.00$       250.00$          1,500.00$       

Fert/Pest Control– Tree/Shrub Per Service 4 37.50$        150.00$             150.00$     600.00$             16.00$     64.00$             50.00$        200.00$          125.00$          500.00$          

Mulch - Installed as Needed Per Yard 100 8.40$          840.00$             30.00$        3,000.00$          40.00$     4,000.00$        40.00$        4,000.00$       55.00$            5,500.00$       

Base Maintenance Month 12 1,064.33$  12,771.96$       1,000.00$  12,000.00$        970.00$  11,640.00$      900.00$     10,800.00$     1,470.00$       17,640.00$     

Irrigation Service - 8 Zones Per Service 6 70.00$        420.00$             125.00$     750.00$             75.00$     450.00$           250.00$     1,500.00$       400.00$          2,400.00$       

Fert/Pest Control– Turf Per Service 6 250.00$     1,500.00$         150.00$     900.00$             440.00$  2,640.00$        300.00$     1,800.00$       150.00$          900.00$          

Fert/Pest Control– Tree/Shrub Per Service 4 37.50$        150.00$             200.00$     800.00$             25.00$     100.00$           50.00$        200.00$          125.00$          500.00$          

Mulch - Installed as Needed Per Yard 100 8.40$          840.00$             25.00$        2,500.00$          40.00$     4,000.00$        40.00$        4,000.00$       55.00$            5,500.00$       

Base Maintenance Month 12 102.04$     1,224.48$         250.00$     3,000.00$          213.00$  2,556.00$        370.00$     4,440.00$       60.00$            720.00$          

Irrigation Service Per Service 6 17.50$        105.00$             75.00$        450.00$             28.00$     168.00$           100.00$     600.00$          45.00$            270.00$          

Fert/Pest Control– Turf Per Service 6 95.00$        570.00$             60.00$        360.00$             25.00$     150.00$           50.00$        300.00$          50.00$            300.00$          

Fert/Pest Control– Tree/Shrub Per Service 4 17.50$        70.00$               100.00$     400.00$             5.00$       20.00$             50.00$        200.00$          50.00$            200.00$          

Mulch - Installed as Needed Per Yard 50 8.40$          420.00$             25.00$        1,250.00$          40.00$     2,000.00$        40.00$        2,000.00$       55.00$            2,750.00$       

Base Maintenance Month 12 127.88$     1,534.56$         500.00$     6,000.00$          275.00$  3,300.00$        370.00$     4,440.00$       420.00$          5,040.00$       

Irrigation Service - 1 Zone Per Service 6 8.75$          52.50$               40.00$        240.00$             9.00$       54.00$             125.00$     750.00$          275.00$          1,650.00$       

Fert/Pest Control– Turf Per Service 6 50.00$        300.00$             65.00$        390.00$             INCL -$                 50.00$        300.00$          80.00$            480.00$          

Fert/Pest Control– Tree/Shrub Per Service 4 50.00$        200.00$             100.00$     400.00$             INCL -$                 50.00$        200.00$          60.00$            240.00$          

Mulch - Installed as Needed Per Yard 50 21.00$        1,050.00$         25.00$        1,250.00$          40.00$     2,000.00$        40.00$        2,000.00$       55.00$            2,750.00$       

IRRIGATION PARTS COST -- INSTALLED COST:  

Rainbird TBOS battery operated controller each 5 250.00$     1,250.00$         57.21$        286.05$             150.00$  750.00$           150.00$     750.00$          125.00$          625.00$          

Hunter 1 ½” ICV-FS electric valves each 5 140.00$     700.00$             23.69$        118.45$             150.00$  750.00$           150.00$     750.00$          82.00$            410.00$          

Hunter 1 ” ICV-FS electric valves each 5 125.00$     625.00$             16.97$        84.85$               125.00$  625.00$           25.00$        125.00$          45.00$            225.00$          

Hunter PRS-30 12” pop-up spray heads each 50 20.00$        1,000.00$         8.97$          448.50$             15.00$     750.00$           15.00$        750.00$          24.50$            1,225.00$       

Hunter PRS-30 6” pop-up spray heads each 50 16.00$        800.00$             7.17$          358.50$             14.00$     700.00$           14.00$        700.00$          24.50$            1,225.00$       

Hunter PGP Rotor heads each 30 13.00$        390.00$             11.97$        359.10$             15.00$     450.00$           15.00$        450.00$          32.00$            960.00$          

RJ Landscape Southern Sunshine

NO BID

Mohican Landscape

NO BID

TNT Lawn/LandscapeVerdego

Location E : Schnebly Recreation Center

Attn to Detail Yellowstone Landscape

Location B : Ocean Front Park / Boardwalk

Location C : A1A - ISB to Seabreeze Blvd

Location F : Driftwood Ave - A1A to Waverly Drive (MEDIANS ONLY)

Location G : South Wild Olive Parking Lot



Bid Reconciliation

0118-0920

BEACHSIDE LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE (LOT 1)

Item Subtotal Item Subtotal Item Subtotal Item Subtotal Item Subtotal

RJ Landscape Southern Sunshine

NO BID

Mohican Landscape

NO BID

TNT Lawn/LandscapeVerdego Attn to Detail Yellowstone Landscape

Orange Bird of Paradise   (7gal)       each 15 55.00$        825.00$             59.99$        899.85$             30.00$     450.00$           25.00$        375.00$          58.00$            870.00$          

Cardboard Palm    (7gal)                     each 15 55.00$        825.00$             59.99$        899.85$             30.00$     450.00$           25.00$        375.00$          58.00$            870.00$          

Muhly Grass (3 gal)                                each 50 19.00$        950.00$             12.99$        649.50$             9.00$       450.00$           10.00$        500.00$          9.35$               467.50$          

Dwarf Youpon (3 gal) each 50 19.00$        950.00$             11.99$        599.50$             10.00$     500.00$           10.00$        500.00$          9.35$               467.50$          

Indian Hawthorn (3 gal) each 50 19.00$        950.00$             11.99$        599.50$             10.00$     500.00$           10.00$        500.00$          8.35$               417.50$          

Trinette      (3gal)                                 each 50 19.00$        950.00$             11.99$        599.50$             10.00$     500.00$           12.00$        600.00$          9.15$               457.50$          

Dwarf Firebush       (3gal)              each 50 19.00$        950.00$             11.99$        599.50$             10.00$     500.00$           12.00$        600.00$          9.15$               457.50$          

White Fountain Grass    (3gal)           each 50 19.00$        950.00$             11.99$        599.50$             9.00$       450.00$           10.00$        500.00$          9.40$               470.00$          

Drift Rose Series (3 gal) each 50 19.00$        950.00$             24.99$        1,249.50$          15.00$     750.00$           15.00$        750.00$          9.40$               470.00$          

Society Garlic (1 Gal) each 100 9.00$          900.00$             4.99$          499.00$             3.50$       350.00$           4.00$          400.00$          3.80$               380.00$          

Gold Mound (1gal)                    each 100 9.00$          900.00$             4.99$          499.00$             4.00$       400.00$           4.00$          400.00$          4.80$               480.00$          

PALM TREE TRIMMING - PRICING:

Palm Tree Trimming - MEDJOOL per Tree 94 35.00$        3,290.00$         85.00$        7,990.00$          25.00$     2,350.00$        40.00$        3,760.00$       65.00$            6,110.00$       

Palm Tree Trimming - SABLE per Tree 790 22.00$        17,380.00$       35.00$        27,650.00$        25.00$     19,750.00$      20.00$        15,800.00$     30.00$            23,700.00$     

Palm Tree Trimming - CANARY DATE per Tree 2 30.00$        60.00$               125.00$     250.00$             25.00$     50.00$             50.00$        100.00$          75.00$            150.00$          

Palm Tree Trimming - WASHINGTONIAN per Tree 40 30.00$        1,200.00$         50.00$        2,000.00$          25.00$     1,000.00$        20.00$        800.00$          50.00$            2,000.00$       

GRAND TOTAL 0 120,688.72$     174,129.65$      132,865.00$    181,815.00$   206,409.50$   

RANKING 1 3 2 4 5

On Bid Response 120,418.72$     65,239.75$        132,857.00$    181,815.00$   42,347.50$     

Difference (270.00)$           (108,889.90)$    (8.00)$              -$                164,062.00$   

PLANT MATERIAL PRICING:


